
May 14, 2024 

Rene Bates Auctioneers, Inc. 

4660 County Road 1006 

McKinney, TX 75701-6617 

Attn: Michelle Bates 

972-548-9636 

Dear Ms. Bates, 

ECTOR COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
1010 E 8th Street 

Odessa, TX 79761 

FILED FOR RECORD 
at f: oo o'clock JA M 

MAY 2 8 2024 
BECKY LANDRUM 

By County Clerk~ex. 

On Tuesday, May 14, 2024, the Ector County Commissioners Court, on behalf of the Ector 

County Joint Purchasing Group, approved the yearly extension of the proposal for ON-LINE AUCTIONEER 

SERVICES to your company. 

The Original Agreement was originally approved May 14, 2007, for a term of four (4) years, with 

Ector County and the Ector County Governmental Purchasing Group. This includes a Compensation 

Commission rate/fee, of 5% for all items, paid to the Auctioneer by each participating Entity. 

After the initial term, the Ector County Governmental Purchasing Group reserves the right to 

extend this agreement on an annual basis, which will be May 14, 2024 - May 13, 2025. 

This agreement may be terminated by either party in writing at any time by giving thirty (30) 

days prior written notice. 

We look forward to the continued working relationship between your company and each entity 
participating in this bid. 



Lucy Soto, CPPO, CPPB 

Purchasing Agent 

Trae Kepley- Amarillo College 

Marcus Bellar, Randy Hernandez- Amarillo ISD 

Patricia Torres- Bexar County 

Susan Serrano- Brazoria County 

AJ Goodson- City of Buda 

Cathy Ezell- City of Freeport 

Barbara Coleman- City of New Braunfels 

Marisa Rodriquez- City of Odessa 

Veronica Bradshaw- City of San Marcos 

Jerry Mahana- ECISD 

Edwina Lane- Fannin County 

Gwyn Hughes- Frenship ISD 

Tammy Himes- Hunt County 

Lance Anderson- Johnson County 

Clint Wehrman- Lubbock County 

Ken Bass- McLennan County 

Cheryl McQueen- Medical Center Hospital 

Barbara Fennell- Midland College 

Kristy Engeldahl- Midland County 

Melissa Mosier- Midland/Odessa Urban Transit 

Melanie Allen- Odessa College 

Sherlonda Owens- Permian Basin Community 

Veronica Martinez- Plainview ISD 

Alyson Villalon-Potter County 

Ricky Garcia- Randall County 

Lucero Sandoval- Reeves County 

Melissa Lee- Tarrant County 

Scott Henderson- Taylor County 

Elsa Montalvo- UTPB 

Carleigh Ennis- Ward County 

Ann Mccuiston- Wise County 



·-

,,_ 

. ;' 

' 
; 

/],~ll.f tt--;r-
HUNT COUNTY BID AWARD 

FORMAL BID #251-24 VEHICLE FUEL AND OIL 
Effective June 1, 2024 through May 31, 2025 

FILED FOR RECORD -
at { :oo o'clock p M 

MAV ') ~ '>Ml • 
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Product Required VENDOR 
BECKY LANDRUM 

Countv Clerk u =-- ,..,h, 1i t>C. 
t:!Y (F " I\ "\ 

Offen Brenntag 
Duka Oil Co., Petroleum, Lubricants, Safety-Kleen Moffitt 

Inc. LLC. LLC. Systems, Inc. Services 

Pct 1, 2 & 3 - Pct 1 -$1 .50, 
$0 .12, Pct 4 - Pct 2 , 3 & 4 -

1 Unleaded Gasoline All Precincts $0.09 $0.04 No Bid N/A $1.25 
t-'ct 1 - :i;u .Ju, 

Pct 1, 2 & 3 - Pct 2 - $0.50, 
$0.12, Pct 4 - Pct 3 - $0.65, 

2 #2 Hi-way Diesel All Precincts $0.09 $0.0399 No Bid N/A Pct 4 - $0.35 
Yes (Remote ' 

tank monitors. 
Fuel Tank Monitors & Inventory at Yes (Smart Tank Yes (Smart Otodata Fuel 

3 no charge to county? System) Tank System) N/A N/A Monitors 

NOTE : Vendors must furnish copy of vendor's invoice reflecting last purchased price with each invoice rendered to Hunt 
County. 

$16.00 (Rotalla 
T4 15W40 $13.84 (Rotella 

4 Rotella (T1 540) 15-40 wt bu lk quoted) quoted) $11.47 No Bid $15.95 

$9.50 $11 .15 / gal 
(Performance (Moffitt 

4a Alternate - Mobile HDE01540 N/A N/A $11.47 (MOBIL) Plus) Proprietary) 

4b Alternate - Eco Ultra Ck4 N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid 
$14.66 

(Chevron 
5 Delo 15-40 wt bulk $15.65 quoted) $11.4 7 No Bid $18.75 I gal 

$15.65 (DELO $9.50 $11.15 / gal 
XLE 15W40 (Performance (Moffitt 

5a Alternate - Performance Edge PE1540 quoted) N/A $11.47 (MOBIL) Plus) Proprietary) 

$535.00 I drm 
$515.00 I drm $528.75 / drm $737.00 I drm (Performance $569.00 (Moffitt 

6 Mercon I Dextron Type Ill ATF - 55 gal (CREST quoted) (Pure Guard) (MOBIL) Plus) Proprietary) 

$66.50 I drm $540.00 I drm $79.00 I drm 
(EXTREME (Highline $1088 .00 I drm (Performance $679.00 (Moffitt 

7 GL-5 Gear Oil 5 Gallon drum 80/90) Warren) (MOBIL) Plus) Proprietary) 1, 

$ 3.88 / tube $4.63 / tube $4.80 I tube 
(MYSTIC high $3.04 / tube $4. 795 I tube (Performance (Mystic JT-6HT b 

8 Grease #GR2 (tubes) temp red grease) (Pure Guard) (MOBIL) Plus) #2 Grease) 
$590.00 I drm $640.00 I drm 

$536.25 I drm $1200.65 / drm (Performance (Moffitt 
9 1 Ow TO2 Hydraulic Oil 55 Gal Drum N/A (Warren) (MOBIL) Plus) Proprietary) 

$785.00 I drm $590.00 I drm $640.00 I drm 
(SHELL $536.25 I drm $1200.65 / drm (Performance (Moffitt 

10 1 Ow TO4 Hydraulic Oil 55 Gal Drum ROTELLA CX10) (Warren) (MOBIL) Plus) Proprietary) 
$680.00 I drm 

$1240.25 / drm (Moffitt 
11 30w TO4 Hydraulic Oil 55 Gal Drum N/A N/A (MOBIL) N/A Proprietary) 
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HUNT COUNTY BID AWARD 
FORMAL BID #251-24 VEHICLE FUEL AND OIL 

Effective June 1, 2024 through May 31, 2025 

Product Required VENDOR 

$655.53 I drm 
40w TO4 Hydraulic Oil 55 Gal Drum N/A (Warren) N/A 

50w TO4 Hydraulic Oil 55 Gal Drum N/A N/A N/A 

Proof of Insurance Provided Yes No No 

Payment Terms Net 10/ Net 30 Net 20 Net 30 

Piggyback Yes Yes Yes 

$710.00 I drm 
(Performance 

Plus) No Bid 
$680.00 I drm 

(Moffitt 
N/A Proprietary) 

Yes No 

Net 30 Net 30 

Yes Yes 
*Offen Petroleum, LLC. - Can offer substitute for Rotalla & Delo if you would like Duron Hp15W40 at $12.18 per gallon. 
Offen Petroleum, LLC. still offers Rotella & Delo. 

**Brenntag Lubricants, LLC. - Mobil Distributor - "We sell our own label as well as DEF 

***Duko Oil Co, Inc. - Can offer DEF in Bulk for all Precincts, including totes with pumps. 

The Purchasing Department recommends the award to Offen Petroleum, LLC. 
the lowest and best value bidder per compliance with specifications per bid tabulation. 
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KEN PAXTON 
ATT O RNEY GENE RAL of TEXAS 

_(L), 

f'LED FOR RECORD 
at o'clock f? I 

BECKY LANDRUM Public Information Act Bycounty Clerk,Hun _n~.Tex. 

Training Confirmation and 
Certificate 
Congratulations on finishing the Office of the Attorney General's Open 
Government training video. New legislation effective January 1, 2006 
requires all elected officials to take Open Government training courses, 
specifically regarding the Open Meetings Act, and the Public Information Act. 
Watching our videos satisfies this requirement, and is done so on the honor 
system. 

Print this page for your records 

Although you should receive your certificate in a confirmation email as well, 

you should print this page for your records. All browsers are different, but 

you should be able to print from most browsers by holding down the Ctr] 

button and hitting the P button (Ctr]+ P). Command/Apple+ P for Mac 

operating systems. 

CERTIFICATE of COURSE COMPLETION 

Public Information Act 

This certifies that Mary Corcoran has completed a course of training on the 
Texas Public Information Act that satisfies the legal requirements of 
Government Code, Section 552.012. 



Gpnfirmation is issued effective this 7th of May, 2024 . .. 

NOTICE TO CERTIFICATE HOLDER: An email has been sent to the email 

address you have provided. You are responsible for the safekeeping of this 

document as evidence that you have completed this open government 

training course. The Office of the Attorney General does not maintain a 

record of course completion for you and is unable to issue duplicate 

certificates. Government Code Section 552.012(e) requires the governmental 

body with which you serve to maintain this Certificate of Course Completion 

and make it available for public inspection . 

Your certificate will arrive as an email from 
noreply@texasattorneygeneral.gov. If you do not receive your certificate, 

please check your SPAM folder. 

If you have any questions, please contact the Open Government Hotline 1-

877-673-6839. 

Back to TOP-



Mary Corcoran 

From: 

Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Office of the Attorney General 
< noreply@texasattorneygeneral.gov > 

Tuesday, May 7, 2024 2:11 PM 
Mary Corcoran 
Public Information Act Training 
Confirmation and Certificate 

This sender is trusted. 

CERTIFICATE of 
COURSE COMPLETION 

Public Information Act 

I, Mary Corcoran, certify that I have completed a course of training on 
the Texas Public Information Act that satisfies the legal requirements of 
Government Code, Section 552.012. 

Certificate is issued effective this 7th of May, 2024. 

NOTICE TO CERT/FICA TE HOLDER: You are responsible for the 
safekeeping of this document as evidence that you have completed this 

open government training course. The Office of the Attorney General 
does not maintain a record of course completion for you and is unable to 

issue duplicate certificates. Government Code Section 552.012(e) 
requires the governmental body with which you serve to maintain this 
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